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Cometh the Hour opens with the reading of a suicide note, which has devastating consequences for Harry
and Emma Clifton, Giles Barrington, and Lady Virginia. Giles must decide if he should withdraw from
politics and try to rescue Karin, the woman he loves, from behind the Iron Curtain. But is Karin truly in love
with him, or is she a spy?

Lady Virginia is facing bankruptcy and can see no way out of her financial problems until she is introduced
to the hapless Cyrus T. Grant III from Baton Rouge, Louisiana, who's in England to see his horse run at
Royal Ascot.

Sebastian Clifton is now the chief executive of Farthings Bank and a workaholic whose personal life is
thrown into disarray when he falls for Nadira, a beautiful Indian girl. But her parents have already chosen the
man she is going to marry. Meanwhile, Sebastian's rivals, Adrian Sloane and Desmond Mellor, are still
plotting to bring him and his chairman, Hakim Bishara, down, so they can take over Farthings.

Harry Clifton remains determined to get Anatoly Babakov released from a gulag in Siberia following the
international success of his acclaimed book, Uncle Joe. But then something unexpected happens that none of
them could have anticipated.

Cometh the Hour is the penultimate book in the Clifton Chronicles and, like the five previous novels - all of
which hit the New York Times best-seller list - showcases Jeffrey Archer's extraordinary storytelling with his
trademark twists.
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From reader reviews:

Carrie Grogan:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be revise about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era which can be always change and make progress.
Some of you maybe will probably update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you
personally but the problems coming to an individual is you don't know what type you should start with. This
Cometh the Hour is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what
you want and need in this era.

Kate Word:

The actual book Cometh the Hour has a lot of information on it. So when you make sure to read this book
you can get a lot of profit. The book was published by the very famous author. The writer makes some
research before write this book. This book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after perusing
this book.

Aracely Schneider:

The reason why? Because this Cometh the Hour is an unordinary book that the inside of the publication
waiting for you to snap it but latter it will shock you with the secret it inside. Reading this book beside it was
fantastic author who also write the book in such amazing way makes the content within easier to understand,
entertaining method but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this
anymore or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book have such
as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking means. So , still want to postpone having that
book? If I have been you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

David George:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended for your requirements is Cometh the Hour this e-book consist a lot of the information with the
condition of this world now. This book was represented how do the world has grown up. The language styles
that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some research when
he makes this book. Here is why this book acceptable all of you.
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