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A crackling, highly imaginative thriller debut in the vein of W.E.B. Griffin and Philip Kerr, set in German-
occupied London at the close of World War II, in which a hardened British detective jeopardizes his own life
to save an innocent soul and achieve the impossible—redemption.

London, 1946. The Nazis have conquered the British, and now occupy Great Britain, using brutality and fear
to control its citizens. John Henry Rossett, a decorated British war hero and former police sergeant, has been
reassigned to the Office of Jewish Affairs. He now answers to the SS, one of the most powerful and
terrifying organizations in the Third Reich.

Rossett is a man accustomed to obeying commands, but he’s now assigned a job he did not ask for—and
cannot refuse: rounding up Jews for deportation, including men and women he’s known his whole life. But
they are not the only victims, for the war took Rossett’s wife and son, and shattered his own humanity.

Then he finds Jacob, a young Jewish child, hiding in an abandoned building, who touches something in
Rossett that he thought was long dead.

Determined to save the innocent boy, Rossett takes him on the run, with the Nazis in pursuit. But they are not
the only hunters following his trail. The Royalist Resistance and the Communists want him, too. Each faction
has its own agenda, and Rossett will soon learn that none of them can be trusted . . . and all of them are
deadly. 
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From reader reviews:

Eloisa Hurd:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important
thing for us to know everything in the world. Each book has different aim as well as goal; it means that e-
book has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They can be
reading whatever they get because their hobby is actually reading a book. How about the person who don't
like looking at a book? Sometime, person feel need book once they found difficult problem or even exercise.
Well, probably you'll have this The Darkest Hour: A Novel.

Alan Dougherty:

The reason why? Because this The Darkest Hour: A Novel is an unordinary book that the inside of the
publication waiting for you to snap this but latter it will jolt you with the secret it inside. Reading this book
adjacent to it was fantastic author who write the book in such incredible way makes the content interior
easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for you for not
hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of advantages
than the other book include such as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking technique. So ,
still want to hesitate having that book? If I had been you I will go to the reserve store hurriedly.

Marcos Gorman:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-book
means, more simple and reachable. This specific The Darkest Hour: A Novel can give you a lot of friends
because by you checking out this one book you have thing that they don't and make anyone more like an
interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you to get success. This book offer you information
that probably your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than various other make you to be great
persons. So , why hesitate? Let us have The Darkest Hour: A Novel.

Frank Wimmer:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library in order to make
summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's spirit or real their
passion. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring as well as can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we know
that on this era, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore this The Darkest Hour: A Novel can make you feel more interested to read.
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