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Colin Pearce is back in action again! Recalled to active duty in the USAF, he's been recruited to solve a
murder and stop a plot to steal the USAF's newest fighter while he tries to stay alive with a $10 million price
tag on his head. Mere months after the high-speed ejection that nearly killed him, Pearce receives a phone
call from a USAF Academy classmate, Bob Barnett. Bob's stepson, a naval exchange pilot named Thomas,
was killed in a mid-air collision between two F-16s at Luke Air Force Base, Arizona. ...But there's more. On
the morning of the day he died, Thomas reported a conversation he had overheard to the commander of the
local detachment of the Air Force Office of Special Investigations, the OSI-a conversation where two of the
most senior officers on the base plotted to sell an F-35 Lightning to Miguel Hidalgo, the most powerful drug
lord in Mexico. ...Thomas told and Thomas died. And now the OSI and the entire chain of command at Luke
Air Force Base is under suspicion, most of all the wing commander, Brigadier General Mark Tappan, a man
who treated his subordinates with such malice they nicknamed him Satan. A man who also happens to be
Pearce's former boss. Pearce is quickly re-commissioned in the USAF as a full colonel and sent to Luke Air
Force Base to investigate alongside of his CIA handlers, John Amrine and Dave Smith. The CIA knows
Miguel is plotting to overthrow the government of Mexico with the help of the Chinese. But the Chinese
don't want payment in money, instead they want payment in a currency they are greedy for-US technology-
technology in the form of the F-35 Lightning. This begins a story of rollercoaster thrills and high-flying
action that starts with a conversation in Annapolis, Maryland and leads to a battle to the death in the skies
over southern Arizona, ending in a nighttime commando raid in Baja, California. Along with way, Pearce
enlists the help of the luscious Lena Otenski, a female OSI agent, the sassy Christine Billings, a fellow F-16
pilot, and the mysterious Brock Black, who may have as many secrets in his past as Pearce himself. Pearce
also encounters his most formidable villain yet, Ramon "The Rock" Petreo, six-feet eight inches and 300
pounds of malevolent muscle. To survive and triumph, Pearce will need more than his trademark luck,
sardonic wit, and spectacular flying skills. He'll need to be supremely proficient and utterly ruthless. And
he'll need to allow the rage that lurks inside him to have free reign. And hope he can regain control. ...If he
lives."
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Clarke:

The reason? Because this The Satan Contract is an unordinary book that the inside of the publication waiting
for you to snap the item but latter it will shock you with the secret the idea inside. Reading this book close to
it was fantastic author who all write the book in such amazing way makes the content inside of easier to
understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you because of not
hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of
benefits than the other book have such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking approach. So ,
still want to hesitate having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Inez Morales:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try point that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you have been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love The Satan Contract,
you could enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is
it? Oh can happen its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Mark Gatling:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many query for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some
people likes studying, not only science book but additionally novel and The Satan Contract or others sources
were given knowledge for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel desire to read more and
more. Science publication was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those textbooks are helping
them to put their knowledge. In additional case, beside science publication, any other book likes The Satan
Contract to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Pam Boyd:

A lot of guide has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the very best book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is identified as
of book The Satan Contract. You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it
could possibly add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most critical that, you must
aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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